
The Kentucky Fallen Firefighter Memorial is a 
cooperative effort of the Kentucky Firefighters 
Association, Kentucky Professional Firefighters 
Association, and fully supported by the Kentucky 
Fire Commission.  

 

This memorial is a tangible tribute to those 
individuals who have made the ultimate sacrifice 
in the line of duty. At present, there are over 
300 names honored on the memorial. 

 

KENTUCKY FALLEN  
FIREFIGHTER MEMORIAL 



The memorial has undergone recent renovation 
and expansion. The apron of the memorial is 
paved with the names of firefighters who have 
served their communities diligently and have left 
us too soon.  

You have the opportunity to participate in this 
lasting memorial project by purchasing a paver. 
Pavers may be engraved with the names of 
individuals, organizations, or associations.  

By purchasing a paver, you are honoring a 
firefighter who has passed on, or one still living 
and serving, while also contributing to 
maintenance and upkeep of this memorial. 
Customized memorial benches are also available 
for purchase.   

Pavers are available in the following sizes: 

 

 

Scan the QR code below for a link to additional 
information on the memorial, a list of names 
etched on the granite, or for information how a 
paver can be purchased. General donations for 
upkeep and improvements to the memorial site 
are also accepted.  

800 Louisville Road, Frankfort 

· 6” x  6” · 12” x  12” · 24” x  24” 


